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RELYCO Approved to Supply Secure Temporary License Plates for the 
District of Columbia, Enhancing Security and Inventory Management 
 
Dover, NH, September 9, 2024 – RELYCO is proud to announce that it has been officially approved by the 
District of Columbia to supply temporary license plates, offering a reliable solution to meet the increasing need 
for enhanced security and better inventory management. This milestone highlights RELYCO's dedication to 
supporting governments and institutions with secure document solutions, helping to address growing concerns 
around temporary license plate fraud and revenue loss. 
  
Across the nation, temporary license plate fraud is rising, posing risks to law enforcement and causing millions 
of dollars in lost revenue for states and jurisdictions. In response to these growing challenges, RELYCO 
leverages over 35 years of expertise in secure document solutions, providing not only durable materials but a 
full ecosystem of services to streamline and protect temporary plate programs. 
  
At the heart of this solution are advanced security measures designed to ensure the integrity of temporary 
plates. RELYCO recognized the District of Columbia's need for printing control numbers, managing registration 
data, implementing secure materials and tracking inventory. These security features, such as micro text, 
barcodes and other visible deterrents, work together to make the plates more difficult to counterfeit and easier 
to manage. 
  
“We’re thrilled to partner with the District of Columbia to enhance security and streamline inventory 
management,” said RELYCO CEO, Bruce Steinberg. “This isn’t just about providing a material; it's about 
offering a full solution that helps jurisdictions better control plate distribution and security. Our goal is to give 
governments the tools they need to manage this process efficiently and ensure no more revenue is left 
behind.” 
  
With over a decade of experience managing state, third-party agents and auto dealer temporary plate 
programs, RELYCO is more than just a supplier – they are a trusted partner. Offering secured custom 
eCommerce sites, robust distribution management software and custom plate creation, RELYCO ensures 
compliance, quality and peace of mind for all stakeholders. 
  
For more information about RELYCO and their complete DMV solutions, please visit relyco.com/temporary-
plates or contact temporaryplates@relyco.com. 
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RELYCO is a New Hampshire-based supplier of unique print materials for thousands of uses. Their mission is 
to connect businesses with the solutions they need to communicate their message – with innovative products, 
wildly reliable people and creative problem solving. For more information, visit www.relyco.com or call 
800.777.7359.  
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